
MTA Bid Results Archive
These bid results reflect vendor-sealed bid submissions as opened, read, and recorded by staff of the MTA’s Department of Procurement Services, for procurements of MTA Headquarters and MTA Bridges and Tunnels. Procurements are solicited through a sealed competitive bidding process.

The bid results show only the relevant amounts contained in the bids. They don’t include any assessment of the bids or bidders, or which bidder, if any, has been awarded the procurement.

You can email questions to BSCVPROCSOL@mtabsc.org. To submit a bid protest, contact David Ross.

Bid No.: OP1835
Due Date: 8/2/2013
Description: Carbon Monoxide Monitoring Equip
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
 Vanguard Controls Inc. $28,468.00

Bid No.:  15074
Due Date:  May 18, 2015
Description: Supply & Delivery of 7 New 2015 GEM Carts Model E2
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
 Fairway Golf Car $96,740.00
 Eagle Auto Mall Sales $85,015.00
Security Dodge Chrysler $88,410.00
Teixera for Work and Play No Bid
Ray Catena GEM of Westchester $89,600.00
Best Line Equipment $109,339.86

Bid No.: 15018
Due Date: April 30, 2015
Description: Custom BEE Electronic Leather Radio Cases
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Altech Electronics Inc $33,807.84

Bid No.: 15067
Due Date: May 21, 2015
Description: Custom Retacta-cade Barrier
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Witmer Public Safety Group $69,913.00
Visiontron Corp $57,993.00
The Tamis Corp $75,354.00
Advance Stachions $90,574.00

Bid No.: 15093
Due Date: May 11, 2015
Description: FURNISH & INSTALL WINDOW FILM FOR 70 INTERIOR OFFICES - 2 B-WAY
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
NY Window Film $15,995.00
New Style Signs $22,323.92
DBR Window Fashions $38,560.00

Bid No.: 15076
Due Date: June 08, 2015
Description: Supply & Delivery of 2 New ZRS TXTA Zistos Recon Scout TXT Robot Kit with Audio
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
ReconRobitic Inc $27,265.98
Zistos Corporation $29,930.00

Bid No.: 15110
Due Date: June 26, 2015
Description: RAdware
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Compulink $19,544.92
Steele Info Tech $17,835.12

Bid No.: MT4137-2
Due Date: July 13, 2015
Description: Plasma Cutting Machine
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Air Gas Allentown PA $53,154.00
AWISCONY Corp $52,915.44
  

Bid No.: 15105-2
Due Date: July 8, 2015
Description: Tableau Software Purchase
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Carah Soft $568,790.31
Triad Technology $553,263.98
Fact & Measures $572,834.32
Tech Valley Talent $564,928.61

Bid No.: 15165
Due Date: August 25, 2015
Description: Sniffer Software
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Compulink Technologies Inc $164,343.46
Packet Logix $168,544.00
AMR Networks $174,233.00

Bid No.: 15245
Due Date: August 29, 2015
Description: Purchase of Lenovo Products
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Washington Computer $24,840.00
Compulink Technologies $24,980.85
QnA Tech $24,692.85
Close2 Da Edge PC, Tech Solutions $34,060.00
Stele Info Tech $24,601.35
Element Box Inc $40,650.00
Derive Technologies $25,132.50
Y&S Technologies $24,241.00
B&H Video $25,026.60
MNJ Technologies $25,062.45
Noviant $29,334.81
Lucille Maud Corporation $24,570.00
PS Business Solutions NO BID

Bid No.: OP4780
Due Date: August 26, 2015
Description: 2016 DUMP TRUCK WITH UNDER DECK AND HOT BOX
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Gabreiie Trucks $529,084.00
Long Island Kensworth $536,020.00

Bid No.: OP4739
Due Date: August 25, 2015
Description: 2016 Rackbody Attenuator Truck Cab & Chais Medium Duty
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Salem Truck Leasing $1,588,190.00
Gabrielli Truck & Sales $1,298,000.00
Long Island Kentsworth $1,388,100.00
Diehl & Sons Inc. $1,506,340.00

Bid No.: OP4737
Due Date: August 25, 2015
Description: 2016 Cab Chasis & 21’ Foot Steel Deck Carrier
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Long Island Kentworth $272,402.00
Gabrielli Truck & Sales $267,648.00

Bid No.: OP4652
Due Date: August 27, 2015
Description: Eight (8) Aerial 2 Type Vehicles with & without Compressors
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Elizabeth Truck Center No bid
Gabrielli Truck & Sales $1,416,510
Truck King International No bid
Long Island Kentworth $1,457,700
Mid-Atlantic Truck Centre, Inc. NO BID

Bid No.: 15290-1
Due Date: September 25, 2015
Description: All-Agency Alteon Maintenance
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Stele Info Tech $ 116,162.00

Bid No.: 15111-1
Due Date: October 16, 2015
Description: Supply and Delivery of HP Z640 workstations and cables
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Comtel Global Services $394,583.00
MNJ Technologies $266,346.00
Derive Technologies $270,848.13
Citadel NY Inc $259,352.63
Compulink Technologies $265,130.98
Stele Info Tech $269,644.21

Bid No.: 15294
Due Date: October 28, 2015
Description: One Year App Sense Technical Relationship Manager
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Compulink Technologies Inc $82,708.00
New CompTech $93,989.00

Bid No.: OP4881
Due Date: October 5, 2015
Description: Various Ford Motor Company Automotive Parts
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Route 2S Auto Mall $2.5%
Parts Authority Inc. $-10%

Bid No.: OP4869
Due Date: October 5, 2015
Description: Flo-N-Dump Parts on an as Needed Basis
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Trius Inc. $5%

Bid No.: MT4998
Due Date: October 14, 2015
Description: Bib Style  Refrigewear , Navy Snow Pants
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Z Manufacturing $24,398.00
Refrigwear $20,876.00
Uniforms MFG. Inc. $26,512,52
Diamond “Power Consultant Group $27,016.00
Diamond Army and Navy Inc. $23,414.30

Bid No.: ISD4806
Due Date: October 29, 2015
Description: Various Equipment and Toll Upgrade
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Idesco Corp $172,267.90
M.S. Hi Tech, Inc. $189,220.78

M.S. Hi Tech, Inc. $189,220.78
  
Bid No.: ISD4807
Due Date: November 6, 2016
Description: Various Equipment for Security Upgrade
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Idesco Corp $144,614.13
Access Control Tech $168,005.07
Access Control Tech $168,005.77
Idesco Corp $144,614.13
Siems $131,835.00
Argent Associates $128,089.36
Graybar $127,669.30

Bid No.: 15407
Due Date: December 2, 2015
Description: Purchase of HP Blade Server with Support Maintenance for 5 Years
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Stele Info Tech $62,186.56
Derive Technologies $63,344.80

Bid No.: MT5014
Due Date: November 30, 2015
Description: Maintainers Hi Visibility Thermal Lined Hooded Sweatshirts
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
The Strong Group $13,786.92
NYSID $15,791.81
Uniforms MFG $14,964.16
Zoe’s Workwear $14,602.14
The Promo Works No Bid
Woods Mens & Boys Clothing $14,636.20

Bid No.: ISD 5149
Due Date: December 2, 2015
Description: Christie LCD Panel Mount and Spacer Kit
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Woodgate Sales Inc. $17,768.00
McCann Systems $13,065.92
CDW Government LLC $15,834.88
Adwar Video Hi-Tech $14,204.00
Tele Measurements Inc. $17,690.00
B&H Photo and Video $19,235.00
New Computer Tech Inc. $15,480.56
Diamond and Power Consultant Group $26,030.36

Bid No.: MT5136
Due Date: December 16, 2015
Description: Wells - Index Model 847 Milling Machine Equipped with a Centroid M39 2 Axis CNC Control
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Fulton Supply Co. $63,867.00
McDowell Machine Supply $70,200.00
Wells-Index Division A&D Machining Co. $68,900.00

Bid No.: OP4985-1
Due Date: December 18, 2015
Description: New Bridge & Tunnel Officer Uniforms
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Uniforms B Parks and Coats $161,118.00
Zoe’s Workwear NO BID
Salsa Professional Apparel NO BID

Bid No.: OP5069
Due Date: December 21, 2015
Description: 4 Year Supply of Sterling Truck Parts
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Campbell Freightliner $64,500.00
New England Truck Sales $64,898.00

Bid No.: 15431-1
Due Date: December 17, 2015
Description: Purchase of Service Watch Support & Training
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Q&A Technologies $698,387.40
Nexus Consortium $698,549.40
Compulink Technologies $708,052.20
Roriama Consulting $734,541.00

 

Bid No.: 15490-2
Due Date: January 19, 2016
Description: SANS Training Services
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Compulink Technologies $134,554.35

 

Bid No.: 15409-3
Due Date: January 21, 2016
Description: Webtrends Enterprise
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Fedtek $69,855.00

 

Bid No.: 15467
Due Date: January 21, 2016
Description: VPN Licenses Maint. Renewal
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Vandis $199,287.00
Compulink Technologies $225,568.83

 

Bid No.: 15468
Due Date: February 9, 2016
Description: Dell Equipment
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Compulink Technologies $48,034.76
QED $45,000.00

 

Bid No.: OP4836
Due Date: February 22, 2016
Description: Various Print Forms
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
RR Donelley $124,224.60
DBS $325,425.25
Haig Graphic Com. NO BID
Drew & Rogers Inc $514,672.50

 

Bid No.: 16070
Due Date: March 25, 2016
Description: Digital File Submission
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Submittable $10,800.00
Westaf $2,150.00
Foundry for Art Design & Culture $17,750.00
Micro Edge $51,450.00

 

Bid No.: OP5261
Due Date: March 28, 2016
Description: Two Pickup Trucks
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Sunrise Chevrolet No bid
Gabrielli Truck Sales $128,200.00
Eagle Auto Mail sales $118,080.00
Long Island Kenworth $134,400.00

 

Bid No.: OP5262
Due Date: March 29, 2016
Description: Two Model 2016 Aerial Vehicles
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Gabrielli Truck $368,200.00
Long Island Kenworth $384,000.00

 

Bid No.: OP5264
Due Date: April 4, 2016
Description: Two (2) Rack body Attenuator Truck
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Gabrielli Truck $267,648.00
Kurt Martin $277,760.00
Diehl & Sons, Inc. $295,028.00

 

Bid No.: OP5323
Due Date: April 20, 2016
Description: STA – FIL Asphalt Patch
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Cold Mix Mant. $56,850.00
Unique Paving Materials $114,000.00
The Pioneer Mant. Corp. $114,000.00

 

Bid No.: 16111
Due Date: April 26, 2016
Description: K-9 Boarding
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Dogward Board $30,000.00
Parkwood Kennels $18,750.00
Snowflakes Pet Center $23,250.00
Willow Pet Hotel $45,000.00

 

Bid No.: 15497
Due Date: May 13, 2016
Description: UPS Maintenance and repair
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
J&S Power Solution $136,710.00
United Power System $112,140.00
Critical Power $123,720.00

 

Bid No.: 16072-1
Due Date: May 16, 2016
Description: MTAHQ 3 year Newspaper delivery
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Complete book and Media $103,835.16
Alpert’s $53,089.92
Mitchell’s $34,087.56
Reginald Auguste $53,395.98

 

Bid No.: 16155
Due Date: May 16, 2016
Description: Motorola Mobile Radios
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
NY Communications Company $109,069.65
SAIA Communications $99,105.00

 

Bid No.: 16041-1
Due Date: May 17, 2016
Description: Motorola Portable Radios
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
NY Communications Company $192,,945.58
SAIA Communications $173,568.00

 

Bid No.: 16111-1
Due Date: June 2, 2016
Description: Canine Boarding Services
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Snowflake Pet Center $24,000.00
RDG Kennel Corp $30,750.00
Parkwood Kennels $18,750.00
Willow Pet Hotel $45,000.00
Quail Run Kennel $23,250.00

 

Bid No.: 5527
Due Date: June 16, 2016
Description: Gerber Sign Materials
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Brewer International $18,908.00
Waterman Signs $23,063.51
Advantage Sign and Graphic $16,664.22

 

Bid No.: 5455
Due Date: June 20, 2016
Description: Cab Chassis
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Gabrielli Truck Sales $222,756.00
LI Kenworth $230,400.00

 

Bid No.: 16076
Due Date: June 29, 2016
Description: Vehicle Graphic Design
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
JMR Graphics $30,543.00
Graphic Design International $45,666.56
Drew & Rogers $104,445.50
Air Graphix $30,683.00

 

Bid No.: 5475
Due Date: July 19, 2016
Description: Portable 200KW Used Generator Set
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
GenServe Inc. $69,500.00
Stewart & Stevenson $39,616.00

 

Bid No.: 16224
Due Date: July 28, 2016
Description: NAVTEQ Standard Annual Server
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
American Digital $100,497.00

 

Bid No.: 16225
Due Date: July 28, 2016
Description: LED Web Application
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
New Horizons $78,250.00
Security Innovations $87,700.00
The Sage Group $269,540.00

 

Bid No.: 5533
Due Date: August 24, 2016
Description: 2017 Cab Chassis Truck with 85 Aerial
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
LI Kenworth $306,100.00
Gabrielli Truck $303,400.00
Diehl & Sons $288,845.00

 

Bid No.: 5322-2
Due Date: August 22, 2016
Description: Sheeting – Aluminum Grade and Diamond Plate Aluminum
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Jamaica Wire & Metals $153,500.00
Garden State Highway Production Inc. $217,830.00

 

Bid No.: 5562
Due Date: September 15, 2016
Description: Car Carriers with Cab/Chassis and Body [2017, 2018 and 2019 Models]
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Diehl & Sons $169,085.00
Kenworth $162,900.00
Gabrielle Truck $164,000.00

 

Bid No.: 5579
Due Date: September 15, 2016
Description: 2017 Heavy Duty Wrecker Single Rear Wheel
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Diehl & Sons $1,073,985.00
Able Weldbuilt $1,052,400.00
Gabrielle Truck $1,141,500.00

 

Bid No.: 5631
Due Date: September 29, 2016
Description: One (1) 2017 Global M4 Rear Broom Sweeper
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Global Environmental Products Inc. $238,900.00
Bid No.: 5791
Due Date: November 14, 2016
Description: (4) Utility Vehicles
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Trius $317,143.00
PGC Landscape $335,553.12
Hudson Machinery $164,000.00 per vehicle
Guthrie Heli-Arc NO BID
Alpine Smith $334,000.00
Bid No.: 16364-1
Due Date: November 17, 2016
Description: Skybox Network Assurance
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Nexus Consortum $131,880.00
Bid No.: 16345
Due Date: November 18, 2016
Description: Portable Trailer
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Chief Fire & Safety $238,900.00
Paratech $258,747.50
Bid No.: 16244-1
Due Date: December 5, 2016
Description: Contract Center Services
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Global Contact Service $51,248.00
Direct Technologies $182,100.00
NYSPSP $206,000.00
Bid No.: 153011
Due Date: March 28, 2017
Description: Communication Vehicle
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Gabrielli Truck $2,647,202.00
Frontline Communications $1,934,000.00
MBF Industries $1,393,231.60
Bid No.: 153820/OP6009
Due Date: April 12, 2017
Description: Under Vehicle Inspection Systems
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Advanced Detection $168,312.00
Bid No.: 8597-0100
Due Date: April 26, 2017
Description: SailPoint Saas Subs Renewal
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
SHI $1,811,220.00
Insight $1,910,470.00
Dyntek $1,745,340.00
Bid No.: 7785-1
Due Date: April 26, 2017
Description: Akamai
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Compulink $ 337,155.00
Bid No.: 159868
Due Date: May 4, 2017
Description: Uninterruptible Power Supply (UPS) Maintenance
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
United Power System $73,800.00
MCS Opco LLC dba Quality Uptime Svc $134,500.00
On Computer Svc LLC dba Unified Power $593,767.50

$501,192.00
$194,601.60

Weissco Power $66,575.00
Bid No.: OP6423
Due Date: May 17, 2017
Description: (5) One Ton Pull up Trucks
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Paul Polito $330,700.00
Beyer Ford $295,075.00
Central Dodge Inc. $314,482.40
Beyer Bros $323,130.00
Bid No.: MT6280
Due Date: May 31, 2017
Description: Green Seal Certified Soap
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Janvey & Sons $276,000.00 per year
Bid No.: IT103114D-CBB
Due Date: June 7, 2017
Description: Black Plastic Bags
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
All America Polly $57,912.64
Star Poly Bag $70,538.56
Interboro Pckg Corp $69,486.40
Westbrook Mrktg $61,156.80
Bid No.: INQ. 9107
Due Date: June 14, 2017
Description: Furniture 8th and 10th Floors
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Empire Office $14,551.84 - 8th Fl.

$104,808.67 – 10th Fl.
Bid No.: OP6426
Due Date: June 20, 2017
Description: 2018 Roadway Sweeper
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Hoffman Int. $228,117.00
Global Sweeping $243,690.00
Bid No.: OP6425
Due Date: July 10, 2017
Description: (2) Heavy Duty Wreckers
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Gabrielli Trucks $748,720.00
Diehl & Sons $777,921.00
Bid No.: OP6424
Due Date: July 10, 2017
Description: (7) Cab Chassis & Medium
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Gabrielli Trucks $1,325,982.00
Diehl & Sons $1,343,993.00
Bid No.: OP6395
Due Date: July 11, 2017
Description: Tunnel Flush
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Gabrielli Trucks $308,824.00
Diehl & Sons $324,000.00
Bid No.: OP6385
Due Date: July 17, 2017
Description: Aerial 2TPE 2018 36’ Vehicle
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Gabrielli Trucks $2,076,126.00
Diehl & Sons $2,241,710.00
Kenworth $2,088,076.00
Marlor & Company $27,500.00
Chalk’s Truck Pt. $176,400.00
CAS of New England $116,000.00
Pallets - R- US $197,690.40
Acne Pallet Co. $186,423.48
AT&T $314,115.68
Bid No.: 110120
Due Date: August 29, 2017
Description: Rag on a Roll
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Fremont Ind. $902,107.00
Bid No.: 177602
Due Date: September 7, 2017
Description: PSIM Maintenance
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Krotos Public Safety $4,567,980.00
Securitas Elec. Sec. $4,385,470.80
Bid No.: 112407 D
Due Date: September 7, 2017
Description: Paper Towels
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
American Pride Paper $45,900.00
Westbrook Marketing $59,850.00
Cable Car Cleaning $92,250.00
Bid No.: 105108
Due Date: September 12, 2017
Description: QSA Services for PCI-OSS Compliance
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
RSI Security $375,500.00
Access It Group $1,701,240.00
Control Case $475,000.00
A-lign $899,000.00
Nettitude $2,148,596.00
Crow Horwath LLP $1,607,000.00
Campus Guard $731,700.00
Experis $1,398,012.00
Crossbow Lab LLP $199,000. 00
Bid No.: 9475
Due Date: September 22, 2017
Description: Web Center Upgrade
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Protek IT Services $399,161.60
CMA $399,200.00
Bid No.: 181009
Due Date: September 27, 2017
Description: Cabling Replacement
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
G Squared Electric, LLC $9,832,609.75
ICAS $4,981,133.08
EIA Datacom Inc. $4,236,469.10
CRC Associates Inc. $10,514,414.00
Malor & Company $71,599.00
Uni-Tel Group, LLC $4,796,774.00
Bid No.: 182999
Due Date: October 5, 2017
Description: Snow/ Ice Removal
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
ADCO Service Corp a) $129,800.00

b) $126,300.00
c) $148,200.00
d) $165,000.00
e) $142,400.00

  
Pride Landscaping, LLC a) $15,400.00
Bid No.: 181347
Due Date: October 11, 2017
Description: Electrician As Needed
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
NEAD Electric $27,410,248.00
Polaris Electrical $33,952,090.00
E-J Electric $28,156,024.00
Kleinberg Electric $28,781,089.58
Barbaro Electric $32,342,801.28
Uptown Electric $30,412,252.30
Five Star Electric $29,283,189.00
Knight Electrical $27,644,239.89
IDL communication $34,218,887.79
Bid No.: 184573
Due Date: October 23, 2017
Description: Fire Eye: HX Endpoint Security
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
SoftChoice Corp. $227,577.60
Malor & Company Inc. $75,000.00
Dyntak Svc. $246,542.40
Solutions Simplified $260,000.00
Carahsoft Tech. $266,824.00
Bid No.: 10357D-CBB
Due Date: October 30, 2017
Description: Purchase of Watch Cap Hats
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
American Custom Apparel $40,139.77
Bear Essential Apparel $42,278.88
Globe Electric Supply $42,530.54
Roraima Consulting $45,298.80
Bid No.: 182082-1
Due Date: October 31, 2017
Description: 5-Year Lease of Canon Image Runner
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Canon Solutions $3,768,559.00
Docutrend $5,974,345.00
Ricoh USA, Inc. $7,376,659.00
Ricoh USA, Inc. $9,599,419.00
Bid No.: 185813
Due Date: November 2, 2017
Description: Inspection of Fire Sprinklers and Ancillary Devices
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Tyco SimplexGrinnel $817,833.02
MJH $2,792,700.00
Bid No.: 173734-GS57
Due Date: November 6, 2017
Description: Fire Alarm Systems Maintenance, Testing, Inspection and Repair
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Star Fire Protection Co. $145,490.00
Open Systems-Metro $131,050.00
Safe Tech USA $117,500.00
Bid No.: 185909
Due Date: November 8, 2017
Description: Schneider Electric Data Center Information Management
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Nexus Consortium $460,000.00
Compulink Tech. $495,423.98
Global Power Tech. $553,911.72
Bid No.: 110123-1
Due Date: November 20, 2017
Description: Supply & Delivery of 9,600 (cases) Trash Bags, Plastic low Intensity
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
High Class Management $267,840.00
Star Poly Bag $314,400.00
Axon Enterprise $323,040.00
Westbrook Management $229,440.00
Wolf Popper $249,504.00
Bid No.: 190008
Due Date: November 21, 2017
Description: As-Needed Purchase of Taser Conducted Energy Weapons
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Axon Enterprise $136,754.70
Bid No.: 113919-RFK
Due Date: November 27, 2017
Description: Environmental Laboratory Analysis
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Hampton Clarke $287,623.00
Skylands Testing NO BID
K.S. Engineers NO BID
Bid No.: 190480
Due Date: November 28, 2017
Description: Water Treatment Services for Boilers & A/C Systems
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Gotham Refinning $398,167.00
Chem Aqua $469,949.24
Thermo Hydronic $481,620.50
Bid No.: 186820-GS57
Due Date: December 8, 2017
Description: Fire Alarm Maintenance and Testing
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Open Systems $395,467.00
Safe Tech USA $392,700.00
Sirina Protection $439,410.00
Safeway Fire & Protection $476,030.00
Bid No.: 192088
Due Date: December 8, 2017
Description: As-Needed Purchase of 3rd-Rail De-Icing Liquid for LIRR
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Wats International $341,509.25
Midwest Industrial $272,475.50
RB Arello $309,551.00
Bid No.: 110123-2
Due Date: December 14, 2017
Description: Trash Bags (9,600 cases) Low Density
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Wolf Popper $249,504.00
Westbrook Marketing $229,440.00
Interboro Packaging $278,208.00
Wats International $286,080.00
All American Poly $214,560.00
JCC $267,840.00
ADI Acorn $297,408.00
Global Packaging $235,200.00
Star Poly Bag $323,040.00
Bid No.: 190490
Due Date: December 20, 2017
Description: 3-Year Blanket Release Contract for various stock items (Communication Poles-
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Kelly & Hayes $1,058,810.00
K.C. Electronics $1,080,770.00
Cox Industries $815,469.75
LD McFarland & Co. $724,825.00
Bid No.: 192514
Due Date: December 20, 2017
Description: Purchase of Nickel Cadmium Batteries, TXL-100-38, SAFT, Federally-funded
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Alpine Power Systems $127,522.52
Abrahams Consulting $124,000.00
Arthur N. Ulrich $309,551.00
Bid No.: 190720
Due Date: December 20, 2017
Description: Purchase & Delivery of (2) Tennant Floor Scrubbers or a NYCT approved equal in
VENDOR NAME BID AMOUNT
Leclerc’s Electric $104,000.00
Leclerc’s Electric $54,350.00
Pina M. Inc. $105,631.00
Edge Electronics $110,320.44
Bid No.: OP 7119
Due Date: December 29, 2017
Description: Snow Plow Parts
VENDOR NAME PARTS BID AMOUNT
De Jana Truck

Wausau Plow $0.00
American Plow $0.00
Frink/Everest Plow $0.00
Kueper Plow $0.00
Western Plow 13%

Trius Inc.
Wausau Plow -1%
American Plow -1%
Frink/Everest Plow -1%
Keuper Plow Retail Price
Western Plow -10%
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